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Introduction and hypothesis: We 
performed a systematic review to summarize and 
evaluate the evidence of randomized controlled 
trials (RCTs) which used acupuncture (AT) to treat 
female constipation.Methods:PubMed, EMBASE, 

Cochrane library, and three Chinese databases（

CNKI, Wanfang, VIP ） were systematically 

searched from their inception to November 2019 
without language restrictions. We included RCTs 
of female patients with constipation, with studies’ 
characteristics and data independently extracted 
by two authors. A meta-analysis was performed 
using the Review Manager software; Data were 
pooled as standard mean difference (SMD) for 
continuous variables and odds ratio (OR) for 
dichotomous variables, with 95% confidence 

interval (CI).Results ： 9 RCTs (N=717) were 

included in this review. The meta-analysis showed 
that there was a significant difference between AT 
and control group in the therapeutic effect of 

female congestion（FC）(OR= 5.13, 95% CI: 3.14 

to 8.39, P<0.00001), stool characteristics (SMD = -
3.08, 95% CI: 0.29 -0.14 to 0.72, P = 0.19), 
difficulty in defecation (SMD = 0.22, 95% CI: -0.21 
to 0.66, P = 0.32). For GRADE, of the 3 outcomes, 
1(33.3%) outcomes were moderate quality and 
2(66.7%) outcomes were low quality.Conclusions: 
Based on the available evidence, the efficacy and 
safety of AT in critical outcomes of FC patients are 
statistically significant, but the level of most 
evidence was low. Larger-scale, more rigorous 
RCTs are needed for further validation. 
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