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Attendees, presenters, and exhibitors from all over the world will 
gather in Madrid for Global Healthcare 2021. We are delighted to 
invite you all to attend and register for Global Healthcare 2021, which 
will be held in Madrid, Spain on October 08-09, 2021. Global 
Healthcare 2021 was developed and implemented in accordance with 
the Committee's accreditation criteria and policies. Global Healthcare 
is a place to learn, share ideas, discuss issues, and come up with 
solutions. The conference's goal is to provide physicians with all the 
knowledge they need to become competent in healthcare 
performance and diagnosis, to address research results and 
methodologies related to healthcare, and to develop and sustain vital 
networks between academics, clinicians, policymakers, and consumer 
advocates. This conference will give all experts in the field of 
healthcare the opportunity to develop research relationships with 
one another and find global partners for potential projects. 
 
The Global Healthcare Conference is an opportunity to meet people 
in your field, network, and learn about the most up-to-date 
healthcare details. Improved health and community well-being have 
the potential to reduce the number of hospital admissions, especially 
for ambulatory delicate conditions. Improved health and community 
engagement will also help to discourage the use of residential care 
facilities that is inadequate and excessive. It will also offer an 
overview of new developments and techniques. Since it offers 
expertise in the industry, it is extremely beneficial to healthcare 
specialists and fellowship owners. It also allows businesses to 
promote their products and have face-to-face meetings with 
scientists, allowing them to expand their market opportunities. It also 
helps businesses to learn more about their industry rivals. 
 
Who to attend? 
 
Professionals from all fields concerned with attention and related 
teams are the target demographic for world attention conferences. 
This includes epidemiologists, veterinarians, microbiologists, doctors, 
community care specialists, public health specialists, internal 
medicine physicians, knowledge analysts, attention consultancy 
firms, and attention headhunters, attention recruiting agencies 
attention investors, professionals in the field of attention, experts in 
the field of attention, employees in the field of attention, and 
companies that deal with attention technology attention societies / 
non-governmental organisations (NGO's) attention organisations 
specialists in the field of attention control professionals in public 
health.  
 
 
 
 

Others include health economists, foundation executives, direct 
service providers, politicians, scholars, academicians, advocates, and 
decision makers. 
 
Conference Highlights 

 Global Healthcare 

 Primary Healthcare 

 Palliative Care 

 Mental Health and Disorders 

 Dental and Oral Health 

 Women’s Health 

 Gynaecology & Obstetrics 

 Cardiology 

 Endocrinology 

 Geriatric and Gerontology Care 

 Chiropractic Healthcare 

 Hospice care and Nutrition 

 Pediatric care 

 Cancer and Related Research 

 Public Health and Epidemiology 

 Dermatology 

 Pathology 

 Orthotic and Prosthetics 

 Podiatric and Health 

 Neuro Health Informatics 

 Telemedicine and E- Health 

 
Contact Person: 

Program Coordinator 

7th International Conference on Global Healthcare 

Email: globalhealthcare@pulsusseries.com 
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