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      Abstract 
Meetings Int is organizing "2nd International Conference on Cardiology” organized in 
Toronto, Canada during September 26-27, 2022. Cardiology_2022 has extensive sessions in 
which the main Oral presentations. Cardiology_2022 is an outstanding opportunity for 
delegates from Universities and Institutes to interact with World Class Experts. he primary 
point of this gathering is to discover all aspects in the fields of Cardiology like Cardiovascular 
infections Pediatric Cardiology, Heart Transplantation, and Interventional cardiology 
research and in addition to other various subjects. This gathering will give a stage for global 
experts to accumulate and share their thoughts in the field of Cardiovascular Care. The 
Theme of the conference Exploring New Advanced Researches and Frontiers in Cardiology 
Scientific Sessions of Cardiology_2022 Cardiovascular Research & Drug Therapy Pediatric, 
Cardiology, Interventional Cardiology ,Invasive Cardiology & Non-Invasive Cardiology, Clinical 
Cardiology ,Congenital Heart Diseases & Congestive Heart Failure ,Cardiac Imaging & 
Analysis, Diabetes & Cardio metabolic Diseases ,Advanced Cardiac Treatments ,Hypertension 
& Obesity ,Heart Diagnosis & Devices Heart Transplantation & Coronary Artery Diseases We 
provide a good opportunity by admiring your updated Research and also by publishing it in 
our respective Journals. We assure our attendees return to their place with the self-belief to 
improve their abilities and outfitted with certified approaches to work with us. This meeting 
will allow the attendees to acquire these new updates and share their experiences with well 
recognized speakers globally. Cardiology_2022 brings an Opportunity to attend the 
presentations delivered by eminent scientists, researchers, experts from all over the world 
and participation in sessions on specific topics on which the conference is expected to 
achieve progress. It brings Global networking in transferring and exchanging Ideas. Share 
your excitement in promoting new ideas, developments and innovations in the field of 
Nephrology. 

 

http://www.imedpub.com/

