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Description
Global health care is a comprehensive and collaborative 

approach to addressing health issues that transcend national 
boundaries. This field encompasses efforts to improve health 
systems, prevent disease and promote wellness on an 
international scale. It involves a wide array of activities and 
initiatives aimed at enhancing health outcomes globally, 
addressing disparities and responding to emerging health 
challenges [1]. At its core, global health care seeks to ensure that 
all people, regardless of their geographic location or socio-
economic status, have access to essential health services. This 
includes addressing issues such as the availability of medical 
resources, quality of care and health infrastructure. By focusing 
on equity and universal health coverage, global health care aims 
to reduce health disparities between different regions and 
populations [2]. One key aspect of global health care is the 
emphasis on disease prevention and control.

Global health care
  This involves efforts to combat both communicable diseases, 
such as malaria and tuberculosis and non-communicable diseases, 
such as diabetes and heart disease. Strategies include vaccination 
programs, health education and the development of new 
treatments and technologies. International collaborations, such as 
those between governments, Non-Governmental Organizations 
(NGOs) and private sector entities, play a crucial role in these 
initiatives [3]. Global health care also addresses health 
emergencies and crises, such as epidemics, natural disasters and 
conflicts. During such events, the focus shifts to providing 
immediate relief and support, while also working on longer-term 
recovery and rebuilding efforts. This requires coordination 
between various stakeholders, including international agencies, 
local governments and community organizations [4]. Another 
important component of global health care is the promotion of 
research and innovation. Advancements in medical research, 
technology and health policy can lead to improved health 
outcomes and more effective solutions to health problems [5]. 
Global health care organizations often invest in research to 
address critical health challenges and develop new interventions 
that can be implemented worldwide. Education and training are 
also vital elements of global health care [6].

Health care workers
Building the capacity of health care workers and strengthening 

health systems are essential for achieving sustainable 
improvements in health [7]. Training programs, knowledge 
sharing, and capacity-building initiatives help to ensure that 
health professionals have the skills and resources needed to 
provide high-quality care. In addition to these efforts, global 
health care involves addressing social determinants of health, 
such as poverty, education, and access to clean water and 
sanitation [8]. By these underlying factors, global health care 
aims to create conditions that support better health and well-
being for all individuals. International cooperation and 
governance are central to the success of global health care 
initiatives [9]. Organizations such as the World Health 
Organization (WHO) and various international health alliances 
work to coordinate global health efforts, set standards and 
provide guidance. Effective governance structures help to ensure 
that resources are used efficiently and that health interventions 
are implemented effectively [10]. In summary, global health care 
is a multidimensional field focused on improving health 
outcomes across the world. It involves a combination of disease 
prevention, emergency response, research, education and 
addressing social determinants of health. Through international 
collaboration and effective governance, global health care seeks 
to create a healthier, more equitable world for everyone.
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